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TEMECULA VALLEY HISTORICAL SOCIETY 

1916 Newspaper Articles & Gossip Columns 

February 25, 1916 

Mrs. William T. Barton left Tuesday morning by auto for San Bernardino to visit with her husband, who went there 
some time last week to act as a policeman at the orange show. 

Joe Winkels has purchased a new, Maxwell through the agency of Frank L. Fernald. 

Mr. and Mrs. William Friedemann made a trip last week to San Bernardino to take in the Orange Show, returning the 
next day. 

Mr. and Mrs. William W. Allen spent a few days last week at Rainbow visiting Mrs. Allen's mother. 

Mr. Hutchinson of Murrieta was in town one day this week on business. 

William Friedemann, on of the proprietors of Friedemann Bros. Meat Market, went to Perris Tuesday afternoon after 
freight, returning the same day. 

John B. Kelly and two other men have been busy every day the past week hauling stone and building stone fences.  
The stone was washed down the mountainside during the last flood.  Mr. Kelly says there must be twenty cars of 
stone on his place. 

Pat Speziali, road master, has commenced work on the bridge across the river between the railroad station and 
town.  He wants to have the bridge finished before the train starts to come, so that the merchants can haul their 
freight. 

March 3, 1916 

Liney Helms, who has been suffering with rheumatism for the past two weeks, was taken to the Murrieta Hot Springs 
the first of the week. 

Mr. and Mrs. William T. Barton returned home from San Bernardino last Saturday.  Mr. Barton is again at his old job 
with the Santa Fe. 

The grand masquerade ball given at the Bank Hall last Saturday night by Merrill Kolb, Ole Larsen, and Charles 
Escallier, was well attended.  The music was furnished by Clint Tripp of Aguanga and Albert Golsh.  Many from 
Murrieta and surrounding country were present and the bus from the Hot Springs came loaded with dancers.  Supper 
was served at Mrs. Hall's restaurant, forty couples partaking. 

Tony Alvarez, who is farming at the Santa Rosa Ranch was suddenly taken sick last Sunday afternoon, and was 
brought to his home here. 

Mrs. Lizzie M. Hall went to Los Angeles Tuesday for a two weeks visit with her sisters and her daughter. 

Mrs. Dinwiddle of Murrieta came to town Tuesday to work at Hall's restaurant. 

Frank Tripp of Aguanga was in town this week on business. 

March 10, 1916 

A. Troeger of Santa Monica, who has been doing carpenter work here for the past three months, left the first of the 
week for his home. 
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Miss Irene Vardy went to San Bernardino last Saturday, returning Sunday night.  

Tony Alvarez, who has been very sick for the past week was taken to the hospital at Riverside last Wednesday 
morning. 

Miss Esther Banks returned to Riverside Monday to continue her studies at Heald's Business College. 

Five teams came up from Pala after cement.  The cement is to be used in rebuilding the mission tower, which was 
damaged during the last flood. 

Albert Banks has a contract to haul two carloads of cement to Pala.  The government is going to repair the water 
ditches that were damaged during the flood. 

Mrs. Curtis Stevenson went to Riverside Monday morning to stay with her sister Mrs. Alvarez, whose husband, 
Antonio Alvarez is very ill at the Riverside city hospital. 

After spending a few weeks with her mother, Miss Eila Kolb went to Riverside where she is attending Business 
College. 

Charles Escallier and Mrs. Ruth Keyes attended a dance given at the Murrieta Hot Springs last Saturday night. 

March 17, 1916 

 

Tony Alvarez, an old resident of Temecula, who was suddenly taken sick at Santa Rosa Ranch, died last Wednesday 
morning at 12:10 o'clock at Riverside City Hospital.  Wednesday noon the remains were brought to Murrieta.  The 
funeral was held at his home and the remains interred in the Pechanga cemetery.  He leaves a wife and son to mourn 
his untimely death. 

Miss Jennie Medran arrived last week from Los Angeles to attend the funeral of Antonio Alvarez, and returned home 
Tuesday. 

Mrs. Camilla Aguirre arrived last Wednesday from Brea, and is visiting her brother, Juan Munoa. 

Dr. Roripaugh was in town one day last week on business. 

James O. Freeman and family left Saturday for Imperial Valley, where Mr. Freeman will start a dairy. 

Mrs. George Simon arrived from Los Angeles last week and is visiting her sister, Mrs. Hall. 

A. Cantarini shipped three cars of barley to the Globe mills last week. 

Mahlon Vail returned the latter part of the week from an extended trip through the eastern states. 

Mrs. Lizzie M. Hall returned last Monday from a two weeks' visit with her sisters and daughter in Los Angeles. 

Miss Mabel Helms came from Elsinore last Monday night to visit with Mrs. Hall. 

Mrs. Amos Kolb has returned home from a visit in Riverside with her daughter, Eila Kolb. 

Mrs. John B. Kelly left last Tuesday to visit with her sister, Mrs. B. Baxter, who lives out in the country. 

March 24, 1916 
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Juan Munoa has been very busy the past two weeks manufacturing beehives for James Freeman. 

After resting for about two months S. Wolfe has started to work again at the Pauba Ranch dairy. 

M. Ray and John Benson shipped two cars of blocks the first of the week to Oswald Bros., Los Angeles. 

Last week Mrs. John B. Kelly made a visit to her relatives and friends in Ethanac. 

James Freeman is bailing alfalfa for the Pauba Ranch. 

Roy Fernald has planted more fruit trees of different varieties on his place. 

Last Sunday Mr. and Mrs. William Friedemann made a trip to Riverside returning the same day. 

A large number of the young people from town attended the masquerade ball given at the Murrieta Hot Springs last 
Friday night. 

J. Monoa (Juan Munoa?) and A. Aguirri and family left the first part of the week for San Luis Rey where Mr. and Mrs. 
A. Aguirri will visit with relatives and friends before departing for their home at Brea. 

Harry Walters and George Friedemann spent Sunday at the beach at Oceanside. 

Mr. and Mrs. Machado, proprietors of the Mission Store here, spent last Sunday at Hemet and San Jacinto. 

Last Friday night a Sunday school party was given to the children at the Clubhouse. 

Trees of different varieties are being planted on our school grounds, which will improve the school grounds; also the 
fence around the school is completed. 

In the near future a new road will be opened from Temecula to Pala.  The old road in the Wolfe Valley will be 
abandoned on account of washouts and the sand. 

March 31, 1916 

After a two weeks visit with her sister, Mrs. Lizzie M. Hall, Mrs. George Simon left Wednesday for her home in Los 
Angeles. 

Mac Machado drove his auto to Elsinore to C. S. Bolting's Garage to have it repaired this week. 

J. M. Nicolas was in town on business one day the first part of the week. 

Miss Irene Vardy left Saturday morning for Los Angeles, where she will visit before returning to Riverside to attend 
the teachers' institute. 

J. G. Martin, teacher at the Temecula School, left Monday morning to attend the Institute so the children will have 
vacation for one week. 

Alex Escallier and two of his little brothers motored to Elsinore Sunday. 

George Watson left Monday noon for Los Angeles; from there he will go to South America. 

Mrs. Frank Fernald and her sister, Mrs. Ormiston Gonzalez went to Los Angeles this week for a visit with their 
parents and other relatives. 
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Paul Clark, a successful beet king at the Pauba Ranch, has a large number of Mexicans working for him thinning out 
the beets.  He expects to have more beets this year than ever. 

J. G. Martin of Fallbrook was in town one day last week on business.  Mr. Martin is teaching at the little Temecula 
School. 

Charles Escallier and Mrs. Ruth Keyes motored to Elsinore last Saturday afternoon to see the Angels practice. 

School has been suspended for the week and the teachers have gone to Riverside to attend the teachers Institute. 

Mrs. George Simon of Los Angeles was visiting her niece, Mrs. Carl Swanguen last week. 

Miss Mabel Helms, the globetrotter is visiting with the Cantarini's. 

Mrs. Antonio Alvarez and her mother, Mrs. Andreas Tortuga, went to Santa Rosa the latter part of last week, where 
Mrs. Alvarez has a large crop of grain. 

A new water tank is being built back of the Hall's restaurant.  Some time ago the old tank fell down and it was so 
badly damaged that it had to be condemned and a new one built. 

Charles Cantarini of Perris was in town one day last week.  He had gone to his ranch at Dry Creek. 

Juan Munoa returned Saturday from San Luis Rey where he was transacting business and visiting relatives and 
friends. 

April 1, 1916 

John Noble has moved into town from Rainbow. 

George A. Burnham and his family motored to Los Angeles the latter part of last week and returned Tuesday evening. 

George Friedemann and Miss Irene Vardy spent Sunday at Santa Rosa at the picnic. 

All the teachers have returned from the Institute in Riverside and school is in session again after a weeks' vacation. 

George Kolb and family have moved into town. 

Charles Escallier left the last part of the week for Spokane, Washington to visit with his sister and brother-in-law, Mr. 
and Mrs. Fred Winkles. 

C. B. Bayley, county assessor of Riverside was in town on business one day last week. 

Two carloads of lumber arrived here this week and were hauled to Pauba, where the government is repairing the 
water system that was damaged by the flood. 

L. Wolfe is in town for a few days on business. 

After a week's visit with their parents and friends in Los Angeles, Mrs. Frank L. Fernald and Mrs. Ormiston Gonzalez 
returned Saturday. 

Mrs. John B. (J. R.?) Kelly left Wednesday for Los Angeles for a short stay with her sister, Mrs. John Carr. 

C. P. Shumate, cashier of the National Bank, went to Elsinore last week on business. 
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Joe Winkels and Ole Larson motored to Perris last Tuesday returning the same day. 

April 14, 1916 

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Magee drove to Perris Monday, where Mr. Magee has a contract to cut blocks for the Aswal 
Bros., (Oswald or Oswall?) at Los Angeles. 

Mr. and Mrs. Machado spent Sunday at Oceanside. 

Joe Winkels, Pete Escallier, and Arthur Serval motored to San Bernardino one day last week, returning the same 
day. 

Mr. and Mrs. Albert F. Nienke, proprietors of the Temecula Valley Lumber yard, went to Aguanga Sunday. 

Joe M. Nicholas was in town the first part of the week on business. 

Hutchinson and Brown sold the Friedemann Bros., fifteen head of cattle. 

Mrs. W. Mouren and Mrs. William W. Allen the first part of the week made a business trip to Murrieta. 

The Friedemann Bros. shipped a carload of hogs to Cudhay at San Bernardino last week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Hugh Magee were in town on business Tuesday. 

Angel Cantarini, a very successful farmer of Monroe, was in town and at his son's Charles Cantarini, place in the Wolf 
Valley. 

Mrs. Ruth Keyes returned from Los Angeles last Saturday where she was visiting her parents for a week. 

At the last school election of this district, James Freeman was elected trustee. 

Mrs. D. J. Tortuga and daughter Emma have gone to the country to spend a week with her parents. 

Alfred Knott sold a gasoline engine to Linney Helm. 

April 21, 1916 

Frank L. Fernald, who has the agency for the Maxwell automobile sold a machine to Adam Ludy. 

Miss Ethel Hall who has been attending school at Los Angeles the past year arrived home Saturday. 

George Friedemann motored to Perris one day last week on business, returning the same day. 

John Z. Barnett arrived from Los Angeles and is visiting his brother, Eli E. Barnett, president of the First National 
Bank. 

Mr. and Mrs. Rex Swain of Murrieta were weekend visitors of Mr. and Mrs. Charles Swain. 

Mr. and Mrs. A. M. Lobaugh, proprietors of the Happy Valley Ranch, left for an extended trip through the eastern 
states. 

Frank Magee left Tuesday for Aguanga where he has some mining claims. 

James Nunke (Nienke) is visiting relatives and friends for a week at Aguanga. 
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The first part of the week Mr. and Mrs. Fred Kurtz motored to Garden Grove, where they will spend a month's 
vacation before returning to the Pauba Ranch. 

Frank Tripp of Aguanga was in town one day this week on business. 

Charles Carstenson returned from Los Angeles Tuesday driving a new Maxwell. 

Mahlon Vail went to Los Angeles to visit his parents and also to transact business. 

Mrs. D. J. Tortuga and children have returned home after a week's stay with her parents. 

Tommy Rawson, bee man from Auld, was in town on business Tuesday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Machado spent Sunday at San Jacinto and Hemet. 

A large number of the young folks from here attended the dance given at Murrieta Saturday night. 

John B. Kelly has pulled down his old honey house and is building a new one nearer his bees. 

A dance will be given at the Bank Hall, Saturday night, April 22.  Everyone is cordially invited to attend. 

April 28, 1916 

The dance given at Bank hall last Saturday night was well attended, many coming from Murrieta and the surrounding 
country.  Good music was furnished by Albert Golsh and Clinton Tripp from Aguanga.  Supper was served at Mrs. 
Lizzie M. Hall's restaurant. 

Miss Esther Banks returned home from Riverside where she had been attending school. 

A very interesting program was rendered by the children on Easter; the church was beautifully decorated for the 
occasion and was packed with Easter observers.  In the mean time Easter eggs were hidden on one of the vacant 
lots and after service the children were told to look for the eggs and the one who found the most would get an Easter 
basket.  Arthur Escallier, Marie Keyes and Luis Escallier won the prizes. 

Juan Menenes and family from the Calabaias Ranch are visiting Felix Cazas and family. 

John E. Roripaugh, George Friedemann and Adrian B. Barnett motored to Fallbrook the other day on business 
connected with the Masonic order. 

Mr. and Mrs. E. E. Beatty of Perris have moved to town. 

Mr. and Mrs. Friedemann motored to Riverside to visit Mrs. Swanguen, Mrs. Friedemann's mother, returning Sunday 
evening. 

Mrs. Antonio R. Ashman and children were weekend visitors of Mrs. D. J. Tortuga. 

For the past week two auto trucks have been hauling oranges from the Red Mountain Ranch to Temecula for 
shipment. 

Robert J. Magee, John Benson, Pete Matson and Jemason arrived from Perris the first of the week.  They have 
finished their contract of block cutting for the Oswall Bros. of Los Angeles. 

Antonio Dorame left Monday for San Clemente Island, where he has a contract to shear about twenty thousand 
sheep.  For the past week he has been engaging sheep shearers. 
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Tuesday night the following folks organized a straw part to Carl Swanguen's ranch at the Santa Rosa Mountain.  
George Hall, George Friedemann, Merrill Kolb, Alex Escallier, Lucien Snyder, Harry Walters, James Nienke, Ethel 
Hall, Irene Vardy, Ethel Walter, Libby Nienke, Mrs. Ruth Keyes, Mrs. C. Walker, Mrs. Lizzie M. Hall and Mrs. A. 
Walker.  After an enjoyable ride and partaking of the many good things to eat the merry crowd left and arrived in town 
about 2:00 o'clock a.m. 

Robert J. Magee left for Los Angeles on business with Oswald Bros., block and curb dealers. 

Mahlon Vail returned home the first part of the week from Los Angeles where he had been visiting his parents and 
transacting business. 

Mrs. Nieves Mouren and Mrs. Hatty A. Welty motored to San Bernardino one day the first part of the week on 
business, returning the next day. 

Mrs. Preston Swanguen arrived from Riverside and is visiting her daughter, Mrs. William Friedemann. 

May 5, 1916 

Mr. and Mrs. John Cantarini spent Sunday visiting Mr. and Mrs. Carl Swanguen. 

Mr. and Mrs. F. Scott and children from Pala were weekend visitors of Mr. and Mrs. Ventura Arviso. 

Rosa Arviso and children have returned home from a weeks visit with friends at Pala. 

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Burnham left Sunday afternoon for Los Angeles on business. 

George Friedemann motored to Riverside the last of the week, returning the same day driving a new Royal Mail 
Roadster Chevrolet car. 

A. H. Schlatte of the Coyote Ranch left for San Diego the first of the week by stage. 

A truckload of furniture arrived from Riverside for the bungalow that A. Cantarini built at his farm north of town. 

George A. Burnham and family motored to Fallbrook Sunday.  Mrs. Burnham is staying with her daughter, Ethel, who 
is attending high school. 

Saturday night a party was given at Mrs. Lizzie M. Hall's residence.  The evening was spent in dancing and 
refreshments were served at a late hour. 

T. A. Wilson of Los Angeles arrived Saturday and will be a week's visitor with his daughter, Mrs. Lizzie M. Hall. 

Four carloads of cattle arrived from Pontona, Arizona for the Vail Bros., at the Pauba Ranch. 

Frank L. Fernald, proprietor of the Temecula Valley Garage has a new seven passenger Studebaker automobile. 

After a pleasant visit with her parents and friends, Miss Ethel Hall returned to Los Angeles to continue her studies. 

Albert F. Nienke, lumber dealer in Temecula is building an addition to his lumber shed. 

Miss Eila Kolb, who has been attending Riverside Business College, returned home the last part of the week. 

Ramon Manzaneda from Dry Creek was in town one day this week on business. 

Mac Machado, A. Cantarini and John Magee left Monday for Wild Horse canyon for a fishing trip. 
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George Friedemann and Harry Walters spent Sunday at San Bernardino, while there Mr. Friedemann visited his 
parents. 

Eli E. Barnett left for Los Angeles the last of the week on business. 

After four weeks visit with her sister, Mrs. John Carr in Los Angeles, Mrs. John B. Kelly arrived the first of the week. 

May 12, 1916 

George Friedemann and Ruth Keyes spent Sunday at La Jolla, returning the same day by way of Oceanside. 

Eli E. Barnett left Tuesday for Los Angeles looking after a carload of hogs that he sold to Cudahy Packing Company. 

It was a great shock to his many friends when they learned of the death of Antonio Dorame who was found dead at 
the sheep ranch of Joseph Garretta, near Box Springs, where he and other campers were sheep shearing.  The 
county officials were notified and the remains were taken to the Clatworthy undertaking parlors in Riverside.  Dr. 
Dickerson signed a certificate of death in the case as showing that "Antonio Dorame came to his death by unknown 
causes."  Albert Banks, a relative of the dead man was notified and the same day left for Riverside to arrange for the 
burial. 

Pauba Ranch shipped a carload of hogs to Oehl Packing House San Bernardino the first of the week. 

D. J. Woolsey of Escondido was in town the last of the week on business. 

Mr. and Mrs. William Friedemann spent Sunday at Fallbrook visiting Mrs. Carter. 

Last Saturday afternoon Mrs. William H. Haynes gave a party to her Sunday school class, a very delicious 
refreshment was served and after playing a few games the little tots went home. 

George D. Pettrie and Miss Irene Vardy spent Sunday at the Murrieta Hot Springs. 

Frederick J. Perry Insurance adjuster of Los Angeles was in town the last of the week on business with Mr. C. P. 
Shumate, who has the agency for the insurance company. 

Mrs. A. A. Barnett of Buena Park is visiting with her father and mother Mr. and Mrs. C. H. Smith at the Barnett ranch. 

Mr. and Mrs. Machado, Mrs. Nieves Mouren, Miss Hatty A. Welty, and Johnny Magee spent Sunday fishing at the 
San Jacinto River above Elsinore junction. 

May 19, 1916 

Mrs. Lizzie M. Hall, Ruth Keyes and Irene Vardy gave a party in honor of the anniversary of the wedding of Mr. and 
Mrs. Carl Swanguen.  The room was beautifully decorated for the occasion with the choicest flowers.  Refreshments 
of ice cream and cake were served.  The invited guest who honored the occasion were as follows:  Mr. and Mrs. Hall, 
Miss Ruth Keyes, Mrs. Barton, Miss Edith Walter, Miss Vardy, George Friedemann and (George) Pettrie. 

Mahlon Vail and L. C. Hardesty left for Los Angeles the last of the week on business. 

Mrs. Eliza Alvarez has filed a petition in the Superior Court for appointment as administratrix of the estate of her 
deceased husband, Antonio Alvarez, who died about two months ago. 

Mrs. J. C. Rodriguez of Valley Center is visiting with her father and mother Mr. and Mrs. (Albert) Banks. 

C. P. Shumate, J. M. Nicolas and Mrs. Antonio Alvarez motored to Riverside Wednesday on business returning the 
same day. 
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Mr. and Mrs. William Friedemann and Miss Libbie Kienke (Nienke) left Thursday morning for San Diego, returning the 
next day. 

May 19, 1916? 

About twenty tons of cement arrived at Temecula the last of the week and is being hauled to Pala, where the 
government is doing much pipe work for the Indians. 

Nearly the whole town of Temecula attended the play given at the Alamos schoolhouse last Friday night. 

Ferral Freeman, who has been touring through the states of Oregon and Washington for the past 6 months, arrived in 
Temecula last Friday night. 

Pedro Mouren died last Friday at Los Angeles.  He leaves a wife to mourn his death.  Mr. Mouren at one time was a 
successful businessman here in Temecula and before his death was doing business at Los Angeles. 

Mr. and Mrs. B. Baxter and children of Ethanac, were weekend visitors of Mr. and Mrs. John B. Kelly. 

G. Tripp, a large cattle owner in Imperial, was in town one day last week on business. 

Mr. and Mrs. C. J. Lewis have returned home after spending a few days vacation in Los Angeles and San 
Bernardino.  Mr. Lewis is the baggage man on the Santa Fe. 

Mr. and Mrs. G. W. Rail and Mrs. A. Welker (Walker?) motored to Los Angeles on a pleasure trip. 

Mr. and Mrs. Donisio Vejar and children left for Riverside the first of the week to attend the Sherman Indian school 
commencement. 

Mr. and Mrs. F. F. McCormick superintendent of the Pala agency, went by town one day this week to Riverside to 
attend the commencement at the Sherman Indian school. 

Phillip Pohlman, one time a business man here in Temecula, now doing business in Los Angeles, was seen in town 
the other day shaking hands with old acquaintances. 

Mr. and Mrs. Alex Borel, Mr. and Mrs. C. P. Schumate and son, made a trip to Riverside, where Mr. Schumate had 
some business. 

Mr. and Mrs. H. Hall went through town Sunday from San Diego, where he had some business interests.  Mr. Hall is 
superintendent of the Soboba Indian Reservation near San Jacinto.  Mr. Hall has been in the Indian service for more 
than twenty-eight years.  He was superintendent of the Perris Indian school and then superintendent of the Sherman 
Institute at Riverside.  Both Mr. and Mrs. Hall take the greatest interest in the Indians. 

George Friedemann and Ruth Keyes spent Sunday at San Diego, returning the same day. 

George A. Burnham and family spent Sunday at Escondido visiting friends, returning by way of Fallbrook where Mrs. 
Burnham and daughter Ethel are staying until the school year is out when Miss Burnham expects to finish school. 

Dan Cantarini and Miss Irene Vardy spent Sunday at Winchester visiting with the Domenigoni's.   

Merrill Kolb motored to San Marcos Sunday to spend the day with friends returning the same day. 

June 2, 1916 

Mr. Jean Nicolas and Mr. A. Nicolas of French valley were in town one day this week on business. 
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Mr. E. Somerville agent for the Santa Fe left the first of the week for a Los Angeles hospital to have his eyes treated. 

E. E. Beatty shipped five carloads of grain to the Gloge Mills Company, this week. 

W. Newport, grain king of the Perris valley, went through town to San Diego last Thursday. 

Mrs. John B. Kelly left for Los Angeles the last of the week to spend a month or two with her sister, Mrs. John Carr. 

The Hyde construction company has started to cement the highway between Temecula and the county line.  They 
have a force of about 150 men.  They expect to finish the work in ninety days. 

Mrs. Nieves Mouren arrived from Los Angeles the last of the week where she went to attend the funeral of her 
husband Pete Mouren. 

The Vail Bros. shipped three carloads of cattle to Oehl Packing house San Bernardino. 

Mr. and Mrs. Curtis Stevenson have moved from Santa Rosa Ranch to Pechanga. 

Mr. and Mrs. Rex Swain of Murrieta were weekend visitors of Mr. and Mrs. Charles Swain. 

Mr. and Mrs. Adrian B. Barnett made a business trip to Riverside the last of the week. 

Last week Mr. Machado proprietor of the Mission store motored through the surrounding country canvassing for hay.  
He bought from J. M. Nicholas 20 carloads, 35 carloads of Thomas Rawson, Hemet; 10 carloads at Wildomar and 5 
at Elsinore. 

Mr. Charles McVicar who left a year ago for San Francisco on account of illness of his sister, who died, since has 
returned and is living at Aguanga. 

Miss Bessie Escollin (Escallier) and Cal. Escallier motored to Riverside one day last week. 

June 9, 1916 

Many of the Temecula people went to Elsinore Friday night to see the play "Ramona" and if proved to be very 
interesting as some of the parts was taken here in Temecula. 

Juan Munoa and his crew are baling hay for J. M. Nichols.  They are turning out twenty-five tons daily. 

Robert J. Magee shipped the last of the week three-car loads of blocks to Oswell Brothers, stone contractors in Los 
Angeles. 

The Vail Brothers sold a hundred head of cattle to the Oehl Packing house, San Bernardino and they were shipped 
the last of the week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Tripp and son, of Aguanga were in town yesterday shopping. 

Mr. and Mrs. Pomo, of the Pauba Ranch dairy, returned from Los Angeles Friday.  They had taken their baby to Los 
Angeles for medical treatment. 

The "Hard Time Dance" given by Miss Irene Vardy and Ruth Keyes at the Bank Hall last Saturday night was a great 
success.  It was well attended, many coming from Murrieta and the surrounding country.  Excellent music was 
furnished by Ferral Freeman.  Supper was served at Mrs. Lizzie M. Hall's restaurant. 

Reginald Attache, one of the baseball fans of the Temecula baseball team, returned the last of the week from 
Sherman Institute where he had been attending school. 
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Mrs. Grant Howard and daughter Bertha are spending a week at the beach at Oceanside. 

Mr. and Mrs. R. Olivera left the first of the week for Calexico where Mr. Olivera will start in the butcher business.  
Prior to leaving for Calexico he had been working for the Friedemann Brothers here in Temecula.  Mr. Olivera 
understands the butcher business thoroughly.  His many friends here wish him great success. 

June 16, 1916 

Dolores Salazar, a Mexican from Pala, who for the past five months has been suffering from rheumatism, was taken 
to the Murrieta Hot Springs the first of the week. 

Miss Catherine Hamilton, who was attending school at Sherman Institute, returned home Saturday, where she will 
spend her vacation. 

Mrs. Luisa Barcello and Mrs. Luis were weekend visitors of the Escalliers. 

Miss Irene Vardy arrived Saturday evening from San Bernardino on business returning Sunday. 

The Temecula baseball team and Elsinore baseball team crossed bats Sunday afternoon at the Murrieta Hot Springs 
diamond.  The Temecula team won the game by the score of 11 to 2. 

After a year's absence, Charles McVicar was in town the other day shaking hands with old acquaintances. 

Mrs. Lizzie M. Hall is visiting with her daughter, Mrs. Carl Swanguen.  She is having a few days of a very much-
needed rest. 

C. Mojado, of Pala, was in town one day this week, buying lumber. 

Frank Tripp, of Aguanga, was in town the first of the week on business. 

Saturnino Calac, of Sherman Indian school, arrived in Temecula Wednesday evening.  Mr. Calac is assistant 
disciplinarian at the school and he is here for his vacation.  He is one of the baseball fans of the Temecula baseball 
team. 

Adrian B. Barnett and Mrs. C. Welker made a business trip to Riverside this week in the interest of the school. 

Mrs. N. H. Norton of El Centro is visiting her sister, Mrs. C. J. Lewis. 

Frank Magee left for San Bernardino by stage, where he will spend a week's vacation and also transact business 
before returning to Temecula. 

W. A. Rowe, of Los Angeles arrived the first of the week.  He is employed by John B. Kelly at his poolroom. 

June 23, 1916 

Miss Ethel Burnham, who has been attending high school at Fallbrook graduated last week with honor.  She is here 
now with her parents. 

Mr. Dickson, who was repairing the cement road between Temecula and Murrieta has finished and moved to Hemet 
where he has more repairing to do. 

George Friedemann and Ruth Keyes motored to Fallbrook the other evening to take in the show. 

Mit Dameiron was in town the last of the week with a fine bunch of cattle, which he shipped to San Bernardino to the 
packinghouse. 
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Mrs. C. Algeria, of Hemet, went by town on her way to Pechanga where her parents reside and where she will visit 
with them for a week before returning to Hemet. 

Miss Helen Chaqua, who has been attending school at Sherman Institute, Riverside, arrived home Saturday 
evening.  She will spend the greater part of her vacation at home with the old folks. 

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Kurtz returned to the Pauba Ranch the first of the week after spending two months vacation at 
Garden Grove. 

Fred Clark, who has been employed at the ranch the past two years, left the first of the week for Los Angeles. 

Mr. and Mrs. F. Scott, from Pala are visiting Mr. and Mrs. Arviso and family. 

Mrs. Nieves Mouren, Mr. and Mrs. Scott motored to Murrieta Hot Springs Wednesday to visit Mr. Dolores Salazar, 
who is suffering with rheumatism.  They report that he is improving. 

Mrs. Mac Machado is building a cement floor under her windmill and tank. 

After spending a month at Los Angeles with her sister, Mrs. John Carr, Mrs. John B. Kelly returned home the last of 
the week. 

Born to Mr. and Mrs. D. J. Tortuga, June 13, a 6 1/2 pound baby boy. 

John Benson left the last of the week for San Bernardino and Los Angeles on business.   

The second baseball game of the season that Temecula has played was lost to Perris last Sunday afternoon at the 
Murrieta Hot Springs by the score of 4 to 5.  Perris led off with 4 runs in the first inning.  C. Valencia, who was playing 
second base for Temecula, made three errors that gave Perris four runs.  Valencia was removed and Perris made no 
more runs.  Both teams were well matched.  The game was very interesting about three hundred people witnessed 

Following is the score by innings: 

Temecula1 0 2 0 0 0 0 0 1 - 4 

Perris 4 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 - 5 

Next Sunday Temecula plays the San Jacinto Base Ball Team at the Murrieta Hot Springs.  Game at 2:30 

Ramon Manzaneda from Dry Creek was in town buying lumber to erect a barn to store his hay. 

A large number of the town folks attended the dance given at Murrieta last Saturday. 

George A. Burnham and family spent Sunday at San Marcos returning the same day. 

Mark Robertson of Aguanga was in town the first of the week buying lumber. 

Hutchinson and Brown have sold about forty head of cattle to the Friedemann Bros. 

June 30, 1916 

Mr. Machado and Charles McVicar motored to Riverside last Thursday on business. 

Mr. George Street of Los Angeles arrived last week for a short visit with Mr. and Mrs. Barnett and Mr. and Mrs. Adrian 
B. Barnett and Mr. and Mrs. Jose M. Gonzalez. 
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Mr. Albert F. Nienke, lumber dealer here, went to Los Angeles the first of the week and bought five carloads of 
lumber. 

William T. Barton has bought a Ford truck and now he will haul the freight on the truck instead of the horse and 
wagon. 

Temecula's baseball team crossed bats with the San Jacinto baseball team and the game was won by San Jacinto by 
the score of 4-0.  A large crowd witnessed the game. 

George Friedemann and Ruth Keyes and Marie Keyes motored to Los Angeles Saturday afternoon.  Mr. George 
Friedemann went to transact business while Ruth and Marie Keyes went to visit their parents returning Sunday night. 

Mr. McCormick, United States Indian superintendent at the Pala Indian reservation, drove through town on his way to 
Perris where he had some business to transact. 

Miss Ella Kolb who has been attending Business College at Riverside arrived home the first of the week and will 
spend part of her vacation at home. 

T. Sakiyama, Japanese, of San Gabriel, was arrested by Deputy Sheriff Henry Nelson a charge of grand larceny and 
was taken to Riverside on the afternoon of June 21.  It is said that Sakiyama bought several tons of hay from M. 
Machado of Temecula.  Sakiyama paid Machado by checks to the amount of nearly $500, then went to San Gabriel 
and stopped payment on the checks. 

Harry Walters, a prominent young man of Temecula, has secured employment at the Friedemann Bros. meat 
market.  Harry is a willing worker. 

The county has started to build the bridge across the creek at Barnetts.  They expect to build a very strong bridge, 
one that will stand the floods.  Next the town bridge will be built and then the one over the Temecula River. 

Mrs. Alfred Knott led the Sunday evening service in the absence of Mrs. Frank L. Fernald who went to Los Angeles 
the first of the week. 

July 7, 1916 

Miss Edith Hall, who has been attending school at Los Angeles, arrived home the last of the week.  She will spend 
her vacation at home. 

Last Saturday night a dance was given at the Bank hall by the baseball club.  It was well attended.  Excellent music 
was furnished by Ferral Freeman and Saturnino Calac. 

The names of eight grade graduates of the Temecula Union School are:  Ethel Gail Walter, Violet Marie Ball, Richard 
Escallier, Arthur Escallier, Matilda Feliz and Maud Fernald. 

Born - To Mr. and Mrs. Joe Chagna, on July 3, a 7-pound baby girl. 

A. Lidisman and son, A. Lidisman, Jr. left this morning by auto stage for Los Angeles, where they will spend the 
Fourth. 

Mr. and Mrs. Mac Machado spent Sunday at San Jacinto, returning by way of Murrieta Hot Springs. 

Frank Torriz of Arlington was in town the last of the week transacting business. 

Wednesday morning Mr. Crooks of Rainbow had a runaway.  His horse was tied back of Burnham's store, the wind 
blew a piece of newspaper under the horse and frightened him, and he broke loose and made for home.  The buggy 
was loaded with groceries and when the horse was caught about four miles south of town everything was on.  No one 
was hurt. 
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George Friedemann left for San Bernardino the first of the week on business, returning the next day. 

Mrs. William W. Allen is visiting Mr. and Mrs. Wulst at Rainbow. 

Frank Golsh, who for the past ten years has been living in Los Angeles, was in town one day this week shaking 
hands with old acquaintances. 

The Temecula baseball team met the Hemet baseball team at the Murrieta Hot Springs ballpark.  Both teams were 
evenly matched, but Hemet got the best of Temecula in the last innings of the game.  Temecula fought to the last but 
went down before the mighty Hemet batteries.  Following is the score by innings: 

Temecula2 1 0 0 2 0 0 0 1 - 6 

Hemet 2 1 1 0 0 0 1 2 1 - 8 

Merrill Kolb has sold his old Ford and bought a touring car. 

Mrs. Antonio Ashman and children were weekend visitor of Mrs. D. J. Tortuga. 

Mr. Oswell and family of Los Angeles and Robert J. Magee went fishing over to the Tenaja country last week.  They 
were very successful. 

July 14, 1916 

Mr. George Friedemann who has been in partnership in the meat market for the past five years here in Temecula, 
sold his interest last week to his brother, William Friedemann.  Mr. George Friedemann was one of the prominent 
businessmen of Temecula.  Last Saturday night a farewell party was given in his honor at the Hall residence.  His 
many friends were all expressing regrets upon hearing of his leaving town.  Dainty refreshments were served and the 
guest danced until a late hour and after wishing Mr. Friedemann success in whatever he undertook they all went 
home happy, feeling that the occasion will be long remembered. 

Mr. Bernard Hamilton lost a valuable horse last week.  Mr. Hamilton was riding the horse home and all of a sudden 
the horse dropped dead, throwing Mr. Hamilton on the hard pavement but not hurting him. 

Mr. Merrill Kolb, who is employed at the store of Mr. George A. Burnham & Son, is spending his summer vacation 
abroad. 

Mr. Ed. Ludy and family spent the Fourth on the beach at Oceanside returning the next day. 

George Hall and Chapo Valencia celebrated the Fourth at Los Angeles and Venice. 

Supervisor John Shaver was in town the last of the week looking after the bridges that are being built. 

An old Indian woman died at the Indian Reservation at the advanced age of 95 years. 

Mr. Alex J. Escallier and Mr. Fred Barcello motored to San Diego where they spent the Fourth, returning the same 
day. 

Mr. George Black of Murrieta was in town the last of the week on business. 

Mr. John B. Kelly this week is extracting some very fine honey. 

Tommy Rawson, a very successful bee man at Auld, was in town one day last week looking after business interests. 

July 21, 1916 
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Mrs. Harry Barton went to Elsinore Sunday morning on his auto truck with a merry crowd of sightseers of Temecula. 

Miss Mary Cazas left for Riverside the first of the week. 

Mr. Won Gar has leased some land at the Pauba Ranch and will start to plant some potatoes in a few days.  Mr. Gar 
has been in the potato business before he came here.  He expects to plant about two hundred acres. 

Marcos Golsh of Rincon was in town the first of the week visiting friends. 

Donisio Vejar and Joe Chawa left this morning for Riverside to attend the institute at Sherman Indian school. 

Mr. and Mrs. Hassman, of Redondo, were visitors with Mr. and Mrs. Albert F. Nienke and family for a week.  They 
expect to return to Temecula next fall and remain longer and expect to build a home here. 

Mrs. Nieves Mouren left for Los Angeles Monday morning on business returning Wednesday noon. 

Mr. Saturnino Calac, who is assistant disciplinarian at Sherman Institute, and who was spending his vacation here 
with the old folks, returned to Sherman the first of the week to again take up his duties. 

Mr. Alfred Knott bought Mr. George Friedemann's automobile for $600. 

Yesterday John Smith and the bus driver from Murrieta Hot Springs made a race from the springs to the blacksmith 
shop at Temecula to see who should buy the little car Al Knott had for sale.  John Smith got the car. 

Mrs. Picart, of San Diego and a sister of Frank Camacho, is visiting Mr. and Mrs. Camacho this week. 

Frank H. Hall went to Los Angeles the last of the week on business. 

George Friedemann left the first of the week for Seattle, Washington. 

Another carload of lumber for Mr. Nienke has arrived from Redondo. 

Mr. Barnes, of Hemet, did some fine painting on the bank's doors, the lettering been done in gold.  It is quite an 
improvement. 

At 6 o'clock p.m. July 14 Mrs. Robert J. Magee passed to eternity leaving her husband and four children to mourn her 
untimely death.  The funeral services were held at the home and interment was made at the Pechanga cemetery.  Mr. 
Magee was taken ill on the night of the 13th. 

C. P. Shumate and Alex J. Escallier motored to Elsinore Friday.  Mr. Shumate went to call on a dentist. 

Ole Larson and Ferral Freeman played at a dance at Monserat. 

Mrs. Frank J. Camacho left for San Diego the first of the week for a week's visit with her husband's relatives. 

The Temecula baseball team met defeat again at Perris last Sunday, by the score of 9 to 13.  This makes the fourth 
game Temecula has lost out of five played so far.  There's no use in talking the team is surely on the toboggan.  Why 
don't you ball players get together and play ball redeem all the games you have lost.  The Perris team was in fine 
condition and played good ball, while Temecula was crawling at the end of the game. 

F. F. McCormick, superintendent of the Pala Indian agency, went to Riverside the last of the week to attend the 
Institute at Sherman school. 

A great many of the town people went to Perris last Sunday to witness the Perris-Temecula baseball game. 
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The bridge across the Temecula River is now being built.  It is expected that traffic will be going over it inside of ten 
days. 

July 28, 1916 

Miss Irene Vardy of San Bernardino was a two-day guest this week of Mrs. Lizzie M. Hall.  Miss Vardy will teach here 
this coming school term.  She has accepted the principal ship in the Union school and will begin this fall. 

Mrs. Allen and Mrs. P. Morrison motored to Wildomar Tuesday to buy plums for canning. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Noble had a run away Tuesday while going up the Magee grade.  One of the lines broke and Mr. 
Noble jumped out of the wagon to catch the horse, but stumbled and fell and Mrs. Noble, out of the wagon.  No one 
was hurt seriously, but Mrs. Noble sustained a sprained wrist. 

James Freeman and his crew have finished baling for the Pauba Ranch. 

Mrs. Wulst of Rainbow was a weekend visitor of Mrs. William W. Allen at Temecula. 

Mrs. Kate Howard left for Los Angeles last week where she will spend a week of her vacation before returning home. 

Mr. and Mrs. F. Kurtz and Mrs. Paul Clark, beet man of the Pauba Ranch returned last Friday from Nevada where 
they went to investigate the lands with the option of leasing two or three hundred acres for next year to plant beets.  
Mr. Clark says that some of the land is very good and if everything goes right they expect to leave here about next 
fall. 

Saturday night, July 29, a dance will be given at the Temecula Bank Hall.  Everybody welcome.  Come one come all.  
Invite your friends. 

Mr. and Mrs. D. Haquioe, of San Jacinto were weekend visitors of Mr. and Mrs. Ventura Arviso. 

Mr. Lyn Smith of Hemet, who is employed at the Friedemann Meat Market spent Sunday at his hometown Hemet, 
returning in the evening. 

Mr. Bob Freeman, of Santa Rosa was a weekend visitor of Jim Freeman and family. 

Mrs. Antonio Alvarez left the first of the week for Riverside on business returning the same day. 

Honorable Cato Sells, United States Commissioner of Indian Affairs, stopped in town for a few minutes and visited 
Mr. Mac Machado.  Mr. Sells was on his way to San Diego to see the fair. 

Mrs. Farnsworth of San Pedro is visiting her parents Mr. and Mrs. William H. Haynes, here in Temecula. 

Mr. C. P. Shumate and family moved from town to their new home about a mile north of town. 

The bridge builders are now working on the town bridge between the railroad and town. 

Mr. Frank L. Fernald is digging a new well near his house; the old well is going dry. 

Mr. F. Scott of Pala was in town Saturday visiting friends and looking after some business interests. 

"Reckiti, Rackiti, Zip, Boom, Rah, Rah, Rah, Rah; who are we?  Temecula!"  Sunday afternoon Temecula baseball 
team crossed bats with Fallbrook at Murrieta Hot Springs diamond.  Both teams were in fine condition but it was an 
easy victory for Temecula. 
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Last Saturday night a dance was given at the home of Mr. and Mrs. Johnnie Cantarini at French Valley.  Mr. Harry 
Walters drove his auto truck with a large crowd of young people from town.  They had a good time and danced till 
about 3 o'clock in the morning. 

Mrs. T. Kolb and children of Rainbow are visiting Mr. and Mrs. Charles Swain. 

D. Vegar,  (Donisio Vejar?) Antonio Trujillo, P. Rodriguez and F. Rodriguez motored to Riverside Monday morning to 
interview Cato Sells, Commissioner of Indian Affairs concerning their lands at the Pechanga Indian Reservation. 

George A. Burnham and son are having their store papered. 

August 4, 1916 

Mr. and Mrs. August Cantarini and daughters, Angelina, Serina and Mary Cantarini left Sunday morning for San 
Diego, where they will spend a few days before returning home. 

The dance given by Ferrell Freeman last Saturday at the Bank Hall was well attended, many coming from Murrieta 
and the Mineral Springs.  Supper was served at the Hall's lunchroom. 

Miss Eva Calac who is employed at Phoenix, Arizona, in the government service arrived here the last of the week.  
She will spend part of her vacation at home.  Miss Calac has been in the government service for a number of years. 

The Temecula baseball team was defeated by Elsinore ball team at the Murrieta Hot Springs ballpark by the score of 
5 to 1. 

Miss Marquard, a sister of Mrs. C. J. Lewis, arrived from the east the last of the week.  She will visit with her sister for 
a few days before returning home. 

After spending a very pleasant visit with friends at Los Angeles and at the beach, Mrs. Kate Howard returned home 
the last part of the week. 

Mr. and Mrs. A. M. Lobaugh, of the Happy Valley Ranch, who left here about three months ago for a touring trip, 
through the eastern states, returned home the last part of the week. 

Miss Esther Banks left for Escondido Friday afternoon for a ten days stay with her sister, Mrs. J. C. Rodriguez. 

Miss Elsie Bethurum, of Riverside is visiting Miss Ella Kolb.  Miss Bethurum and Miss Kolb are students of the 
Riverside Business College. 

George A. Burnham and family left the first part of the week on a pleasure trip to Lake Tahoe.  They will travel by 
automobile.  Mr. Burnham and family will visit all through the northern part of California before returning home.  They 
will be gone six weeks. 

On August 6, the Temecula baseball team will cross bats with Fallbrook at Fallbrook.  These two teams have won two 
games each this season and it ought to be a good game. 

Classifieds 

FOR SALE - Horse, buggy and harness, price $100, if taken soon.  All in fine shape.  A new buggy worth $100.  
William H. Haynes, Temecula, CA  (July 7-4t) 
 
August 11, 1916 

Last Saturday night a social was given by Mrs. William T. Barton at her residence.  Refreshments of ice cream and 
cake were served.  
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Seven carloads of fine steers were shipped by the Vail Brothers of the Pauba Ranch to the Ochl Packing house, San 
Bernardino. 

G. Triff has leased four hundred acres of pastureland near Murrieta and yesterday took his droves of cattle to the 
pasture. 

Mrs. John B. Kelly returned home the last of the week from Ethanac, where she was visiting with the Baxters. 

Albert Banks has bought a five passenger Ford. 

The bridge construction company has finished driving the piles and has moved to El Casco, where they will do some 
more bridgework. 

Albert F. Nienke is building sheds over his lumber to protect it from the rains.  Mr. Nienke is doing good business; in 
the near future he is going to build a nice bungalow across the tract by the foothills in the residence section of town. 

Miss Grace Baxter of Ethanac is visiting her uncle and aunt, Mr. and Mrs. John B. Kelly. 

Mrs. Antonio Alvarez was a weekend visitor of Mrs. D. J. Tortuga and family. 

Lynn Smith one day last week had the misfortune of steeping on a nail.  It went through his shoe and into his foot.  He 
suffered severe pain, but at the present writing is improving. 

Robert J. Magee returned home from Cahuilla the last of the week.  Mr. Magee was cutting stone posts and 
monument bases. 

Henry Winneberg has left for Rockland, where he has an employment in cutting blocks. 

Mrs. Frank Camacho returned home Sunday from San Diego where she was visiting relatives and friends. 

Sunday afternoon the Fallbrook baseball team was again defeated by the Temecula baseball team by a score of 13 
to 4. 

I. C. Johnson, (J. C.?) station agent at Rialto, is spending a few days of the vacation with Mr. and Mrs. William T. 
Barton.  Mr. Johnson was station agent here a few years ago.  

August 18, 1916 
Cutting Affray Near Temecula 
Tom Baird runs amuck and three men are badly slashed by him. 
City Marshal Charles Townsend and C. S. Wright returned Friday from a search for Tom Baird, who Sunday night cut 
three of his fellow workmen at the Hyde Construction camp below Temecula and made his escape in one of the San 
Diego stages. 
A warrant was sworn out Tuesday night.  This gave the marshal a start so far behind the fellow that he was unable to 
apprehend him.  He was traced to Oceanside and the officers went into Mexico looking for him but got no trace. 
Tom Baird, the man who cut three fellow workmen with a knife Sunday night, August 6, at the Hyde Construction 
camp below Temecula and was traced to Oceanside by City Marshal Townsend, was arrested Saturday, a week 
later, in San Diego. 
Tuesday afternoon he was brought before Justice Carter for a preliminary hearing.  Sheriff Wilson, brought the 
prisoner here, and accompanied by Deputy District Attorney (Kely?) and a court reporter. 
The warrant charging Baird with assault with a deadly weapon was sworn in by George T. Williams, a blacksmith at 
the construction camp.  Baird was Williams' helper.  Williams' face was cut from his ear to the point of his chin.  
Testimony brought on the fact that a dozen and half bottles of booze were probably active agents in the mix up.  
Harry Greely, who was cut on the nose, could not be located, but Sam Bates, who was cut across the throat, was 
present at the hearing.  Fred J. Ludy, a witness called by Baird, was found to know nothing about the affair and F. D. 
Berrigan, another witness for Baird, was not put on the stand.  Rex Carson, yet another Baird witness was found to 
be under arrest in San Diego for forgery. 
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Baird preferred not to give testimony at this time, but it is safe to say that the court reporter did not neglect to take 
down some interesting remarks, which he made during the trail relative to what "the other fellows" did to him before 
he pulled his knife. 
Baird was held to answer in the superior court of Riverside County and was placed under $2000 bail.  He is a convict 
out under parole, and has been reporting to Marshal Townsend every month. 
 
August 18, 1916 

The Temecula baseball team met the Elsinore team at Hot Springs ballpark.  Elsinore was defeated by the score of 
11 to 1 being a one sided game. 

Mr. Crooks of Rainbow lately has been very unfortunate.  Three weeks ago his horse ran away with the buggy and 
Thursday afternoon his team ran away with the wagon.  They broke loose and started for home but were caught 
about a mile south of town.  No one was hurt. 

Paul Clark is hauling and shipping some very fine sugar beets. 

A social party was given at the home of Mr. and Mrs. John Cantarini Saturday night, a good many of the young 
people from Temecula attending and report a very good time. 

A. Ledisma returned from Los Angeles the last of the week.  Mr. Ledisma had been ill for a few days and he went to 
Los Angeles for treatment. 

Mr. Harry Larsen of Los Angeles is visiting with the Hall's this week. 

Mr. George D. Pettrie, fireman on the Santa Fe, is the owner of an International automobile. 

Miss Sarah Kaa of Los Angeles is visiting Mr. and Mrs. Carl Swanguen. 

Born to Mr. and Mrs. William Friedemann a 91/2-pound boy, August 3.  They are most happy parents. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ed Ludy and children returned home Saturday after spending ten days at Oceanside. 

Mr. and Mrs. Alfred Knott are rejoicing over the arrival of lovely twin babies, boy and girl, born August 11. 

Linny Helm and C. P. Shumate left the first of the week for Imperial on business. 

Mrs. E. Somerville went to Reedly, California, the first of the week to stay with her sister, Mrs. E. P. Snyder, who has 
been ill. 

Clinton Tripp of Aguanga was in town one day this week looking after business interests. 

Mahlon Vail and James Thomas left for Imperial Wednesday morning on business.  They will be gone for about ten 
days. 

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Banks motored to Escondido the first of the week to visit with their daughter, Mrs. J. C. 
Rodriguez. 

Mr. and Mrs. A. Mesa and children and Mrs. L. Gomez and children arrived from San Luis Rey to spend a few days 
with their father, D. Munoa, and brother Juan Munoa. 

Mrs. M. P. McHugh and daughter of Fresno arrived the first of the week for a two weeks' visit at the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Frank Burnham.  Mrs. McHugh is a sister of Mrs. Frank Burnham. 
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Mrs. William T. Barton and daughter, Ethel, Mrs. Lizzie M. Hall and Mrs. Simon left the first of the week for San 
Francisco.  They expect to be gone for three or four weeks. 

After spending a very pleasant three weeks visiting with her sister, Mrs. C. J. Lewis, Mrs. N. H. Norton left for San 
Diego where she will visit before returning to her home at Imperial Valley. 

George Kolb who went to Arizona a month ago returned home this week. 

Joe Winkels and Jim Able left the first of the week for San Francisco.  They will make the drive in their machine and 
visit San Francisco for about ten days. 

August 25, 1916 

 

Mrs. Henry McConville of Los Angeles is visiting her sister.  Miss M. A. Welty and Miss Hattie Welty, proprietors of 
the Temecula Hotel. 

Eli E. Barnett and family motored to San Diego the last of the week to spend a few days seeing the exposition and 
the city in general. 

Mr. and Mrs. R. R. Shrode have moved to Colton.  Mr. Shrode was in partnership with Eli E. Barnett in the dairy 
business in Temecula. 

Mr. Roet of Elsinore went through town on his way to San Diego the first of the week, stopping at M. Machado's store 
to transact business. 

Mit Demoren and Judd Tripp passed through town with a drove of cattle to Santa Ana. 

A. E. Buck of Auld was in town the first part of the week on business. 

George Block (Black?) of Murrieta was in town one day this week looking after business interests. 

A large number of the young people from here attended the dance given at Murrieta.  They all report having had a 
good time. 

Harry Walters is the owner of a new five passenger touring Ford. 

Mr. and Mrs. Brubaker and Mr. Vail were dinner guests of Mr. and Mrs. Mac Machado Tuesday. 

Saturday night, September 2, a dance will be given by Ferral Freeman at the Temecula Bank Hall.  Excellent music 
will be furnished by Mr. Freeman.  A cordial invitation is extended to all. 

Mrs. A. Welker and Mrs. C. Welker and daughter moved to Riverside last Thursday.  Mrs. C. Welker for the past two 
years was teaching school in Temecula.  She mad many friends who regret very much in see her leave.  The next 
school term Mrs. C. Welker will teach in Riverside. 

The highway between Temecula and the San Diego county line is nearly finished and in a very short time the road 
will be open for travel. 

Tom Powers and Reginald Attache, two crack players of the Temecula baseball team left the last of the week for 
Sherman Institute.  They went back again to take up their studies.  They will be greatly missed by the local fans. 

September 2, 1916 
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Mrs. F. Escallin (Escallier?) and Miss Bessie Escallin (Escallier?) left the first of the week for Los Angeles where they 
will visit relatives and friends. 

After spending a two weeks' visit in San Francisco and Los Angeles, Mrs. Lizzie M. Hall returned home the first of the 
week and is at her duty in the restaurant. 

Frank Ramos sustained a very painful accident one day last week while riding a motorcycle.  He was thrown off and 
sprained his wrist and consequences are that for a few weeks he will carry his arm in a sling. 

Mr. and Mrs. John E. Roripaugh and family and Mr. and Mrs. Eli E. Barnett have returned home after spending a few 
days at San Diego. 

A. E. Buck of Auld is hauling his grain to Temecula and shipping it away. 

Mrs. William T. Barton returned home Wednesday where she was spending a week.  On her way home she stopped 
at Los Angeles and visited friends. 

Mrs. Antonio Alvarez has sold all her grain to E. E. Beautty of Perris. 

George A. Burnham and family returned home Saturday from their outing trip.  They toured all through the northern 
part of the state.  They spent the most of their vacation at Lake Tahoe. 

William H. Haynes is building a small neat garage.  In the near future he is going to buy an auto. 

Joe Hamilton of San Jacinto was in town one day this week looking after business interests. 

The Hyde Construction Company has finished putting in the cement between Temecula and the county line. 

Joe Winkels and Jim Abel arrived in Temecula the last of the week from San Francisco where they had been 
spending a few days' vacation. 

Carl Torbett was in Elsinore Monday. 

George Street of Los Angeles arrived at Adrian B. Barnett's Saturday evening.  While here he will paint the 
schoolhouse.  Mr. Street is a painter by trade.  He has done some painting here before and it has been very 
satisfactory. 

September 8, 1916 

Mr. and Mrs. Charles McClintock are visiting Mr. and Mrs. Eli E. Barnett.  Mr. McClintock is working for the terra cotta 
works at Los Milos.  He is here for a very much-needed rest. 

The Temecula Union School will begin the fall session September 11, with Miss Irene and Miss Friedemann as 
teachers. 

Del Clark of Elsinore is doing the carpenter work on the garage of William H. Haynes. 

Mr. and Mrs. George A. Burnham and daughter spent Sunday at San Diego seeing the exposition. 

John E. Roripaugh, G. Golsh and Charles McVicker left Saturday afternoon for the Cahuilla Mountains on a deer-
hunting trip. 

Mr. and Mrs. Mac Machado spent Sunday at Elsinore. 



 22 

Mr. and Mrs. Frank L. Fernald returned home the last of the week from San Diego, where they spent a few days 
seeing the exposition. 

Eli E. Barnett and Joe Winkels motored to Riverside with the Serval brothers last Wednesday as witnesses for the 
Serval brothers, who went to get their naturalization papers. 

Joe Welty and Charles Cartinsen have bought Miss M. A. Welty's house and lot on the north side of town. 

Miss Ethel Hall returned home the last of the week after enjoying a very pleasant visit with friends at San Marcos. 

Mr. and Mrs. T. F. McCormick of Pala were in town last Thursday on business. 

Allen Schain of San Jacinto is visiting his sister, Mrs. William T. Barton. 

Mrs. C. J. Lewis, who has lived here for the past two years left Friday morning for Los Angeles, where her future 
home will be.  She was accompanied by her sister, Miss Marquardt.  Mrs. Lewis' husband is the baggage man on the 
Santa Fe and expects to work on the line between Los Angeles and San Diego. 

The dance given by Ferrell Freeman was well attended.  38 couples being on the floor at one time.  Supper was 
served at Mrs. Hall's lunchrooms. 

Mrs. Mary Freeman who for the past year has resided at El Centro arrived at Temecula last week and is stopping at 
the Arviso's home. 

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Banks and children spent Sunday at Oceanside. 

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Hamilton and children of San Jacinto were first of the week visitors of the Escallier family. 

Joe Winkels has a contract of fifty thousand blocks, ten thousand to go to Los Angeles and forty thousand to go to 
San Pedro.  Mr. Winkels has a force of men cutting the blocks now. 

Mrs. Ruth Keyes and daughter Marie left Saturday afternoon for Los Angeles, where she will visit with her parents.  
She expects to be in Los Angeles two weeks before returning.  For over a year Mrs. Keyes has been working at the 
Hall's lunchroom. 

September 15, 1916 

John Noble and his two sons went on a fishing trip to the Devil's Canyon and were very successful in catching many 
fish. 

Mr. and Mrs. E. J. Holland are back at Temecula again and they have come to stay.  Mr. Holland is again working on 
the Santa Fe.  Their many friends are glad to have them come back. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ed Ludy and children have just returned home after spending two weeks at Imperial Valley.  Mr. Ludy 
says that it is quite hot there yet and there isn't much doing. 

Mr. and Mrs. A. B. White and Mr. and Mrs. H. Wilson all from Los Angeles arrived in Temecula the last of the week 
and are visiting Mr. and Mrs. Frank H. Hall and family.  Mr. Wilson and Mrs. White are brother and sister of Mrs. Hall.  
Mr. Wilson in the service of Uncle Sam as mail carrier and Mr. White holds a position of detective. 

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Burnham left the first of the week for a camping trip at Idyllwild.  Mr. Burnham needs a good rest. 

Miss Irene Vardy of San Bernardino arrived here the middle of the week ready for the schoolwork this coming term. 
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Hugh Magee was in town one day this week having his thresher repaired getting it ready to thresh his beans upon the 
hill. 

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Banks and children are spending a few days at Escondido taking in the fair. 

D. J. Woosley of Escondido was in town one day this week looking after business interests. 

Mrs. John B. Kelly and Miss Zoe D. Carr left Sunday afternoon by stage to the beach at Oceanside where Mrs. Kelly 
will join her husband.  They will spend a few days before returning home. 

Last Saturday night a social party was given by Mr. and Mrs. John Cantarini at their home in French Valley.  It was 
well attended, many of the young folk from town attending. 

The Hyde Construction Company has finished the boulevard between Temecula and the county line.  It is open for 
travel now. 

September 22, 1916 

After a very pleasant visit with friends and relatives here in Temecula, Mr. and Mrs. A. B. White and Mr. and Mrs. H. 
Wilson all of Los Angeles, left for their homes the early part of the week. 

Mrs. J. C. Rodriguez of Escondido is visiting her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Albert Banks. 

The C. L. Hyde Construction Company, road builders, left the first of the week for Ventura, where they have another 
contract of road building. 

Mr. and Mrs. John B. Kelly and Mrs. Zoe D. Carr have returned home from the beach at Oceanside. 

Albert F. Nienke is building sheds for his lumberyards to protect the lumber from the wet weather. 

John Noble has been appointed janitor of the Temecula union School. 

Ole Larsen is building an extension of thirty feet to his barbershop.  This room will be a pool hall and he will have two 
or more pool tables.  Mr. Larsen has been in business here for the past ten months. 

The Santa Fe has a force of about a hundred men laying a spur tract close to the riverbank in order to dump rock. 

Miss Hattie A. Welty left the first of the week for Catalina Island where she will spend two weeks' vacation. 

I. Parks of Cahuilla brought to the Santa Fe stockyards a hundred head of fine cattle and they were shipped to Santa 
Ana yesterday. 

Mac Machado, August Cantarini, and John Magee left Saturday morning for Aguanga where they will spend a few 
days fishing. 

Mrs. J. C. Rodriguez of Escondido arrived the first of the week and is visiting her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Albert Banks 
and family. 

Saturday night, September 23, a dance will be given at the bank hall.  A cordial invitation is extended to all. 

William H. Haynes is a happy owner of a five-passenger Saxon Six. 

Albert F. Nienke has sold a large bill of lumber to Ole Larsen for the building of the new poolroom.  Mr. Larsen 
expects to have everything in running order by the last of the week. 
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The Temecula union school began the fall term on September 11 with Miss Irene Vardy and Miss Friedemann as 
teachers. 

The bank is undergoing a coat of paint. 

Mrs. Carl Swanguen is visiting friends and relatives in Los Angeles this week. 

Mrs. William T. Barton, Harry Walters, Ethel Walters and Libbie Nienke spent Sunday at Pomona visiting friends and 
relatives returning Sunday evening. 

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Tripp of Aguanga were weekend visitors of Mr. and Mrs. John Magee. 

D. J. Woosley of Escondido was in town the first of the week looking after business interests. 

Mrs. Keeler of Los Angeles is this week the guest of Mr. and Mrs. Mac Machado.  Mrs. Keeler is a sister to Mrs. 
Machado. 

A few of the town people spent Sunday at the Indian (fiesta?) at Soboba reservation about three miles beyond San 
Jacinto. 

After a very pleasant visit with her uncle and aunt, Mr. and Mrs. John B. Kelly, Miss Zoe D. Carr returned to Los 
Angeles that last of the week. 

September 29, 1916 

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Golsh, who have lived at the Magee place, moved into town the first part of the week. 

Aug. Cantarini, Mr. Machado, Dan E. Cantarini and John Magee, who for the past week have been at the Tenaja 
country fishing, returned home the last of the week loaded with fish.  They say they were very successful, catching 
about 200 fish. 

John B. Kelly made a business trip to Los Angeles last week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Hart left Sunday morning by auto to the beach at Oceanside.  They will be gone two weeks. 

Alex J. Escallier, S. Street, Miss Irene Vardy and Miss Ethel Hall spent Sunday at the beach at Oceanside, returning 
the same day. 

The pool hall of the Escallier Bros. is undergoing a coat of paint. 

Mrs. C. B. Pope of Pomona is visiting Mr. and Mrs. William T. Barton and family. 

Frank Ramos left for Sherman Institute Saturday noon on the auto stage.  He went there to continue his studies. 

C. P. Shumate is another happy owner of a new five passenger touring 1917 Ford car in Temecula. 

Harry Walters, Ethel Walters, Arthur Escallier, Richard Escallier, Ethel Hall and James Nienke are attending Elsinore 
high school.  They leave here every morning and come back every night. 

James E. Freeman of El Centro was in town one day last week looking after business interests. 

Elvetzi Cantarini and C. P. Shumate motored to Hemet last Tuesday afternoon, returning the same evening. 

Mr. and Mrs. Frank A. Burnham returned home the last of the week after spending a two weeks' vacation at Idyllwild. 
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The dance given at the Bank hall by Larsen and Harris was well attended.  Supper was served at Mrs. Lizzie M. Hall's 
lunchrooms. 

Mabel and Lizzie Helm came down from Elsinore to attend the dance. 

After spending a very pleasant time at Los Angeles visiting her parents Mrs. Ruth Keyes and daughter, Marie 
returned the first of the week and is again at her work. 

October 6, 1916 

Mark Robertson of Aguanga was in town Friday.  Mr. Robertson has been hauling freight to Oak Grove. 

Mrs. John Sanders was a first of the week visitor of Mr. and Mrs. Frank Camacho. 

Mr. and Mrs. J. E. Freeman made a business trip to Riverside the last of the week returning the next day. 

Mrs. Esther Banks is again attending the Riverside Business College. 

Mr. James Rawson will teach at the little Temecula School this coming term.  This school will be one month late in 
beginning the term because Mr.. Martin who was supposed to teach did not or could not come. 

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Kurtz of Garden Grove arrived the first of the week and are stopping at the Pauba Ranch, with Mrs. 
Kurtz's brother, Paul Clark, beet king. 

Mr. John Z. Barnett is this week visiting his brother, Eli E. Barnett and family. 

Mrs. C. Wulst of Rainbow is visiting Mrs. William W. Allen. 

Mrs. Carl Swanguen has just returned from Los Angeles where for three weeks she was visiting relatives and friends. 

Messrs.. Ferrell Freeman and Albert Banks returned yesterday from a deer hunt trip.  Mr. Freeman killed a fine big 
buck. 

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Banks and family motored to Escondido Sunday. 

Mrs. J. C. Rodriguez left Sunday for her home at Escondido.  Mrs. Rodriguez has been visiting her parents Mr. and 
Mrs. Albert Banks for the past two weeks. 

J. E. Freeman left the last of the week for El Centro, Imperial County.  Mrs. Freeman was here looking after some 
very important business interests.  

Last week Sunday Harry Walters met with an accident.  On his way home about a mile or two out of Murrieta, he met 
another machine, they both failed to turn out far enough, and the consequences were that both machines came 
together and were wrecked.  Harry's machine was upset and badly damaged and so was the other but nobody hurt. 

Saturday Mr. and Mrs. Albert Golsh left for Pala to attend the funeral of their stepfather who passed to eternity at the 
advanced age of 70 years. 

William W. Allen, who for the past three weeks has been working on the county road at Riverside, returned home the 
last of the week. 

Mr. and Mrs. T. Pa, of San Jacinto, were weekend visitors of Mr. and Mrs. John Magee and family. 

Congressman William Kettner, of San Diego and candidate for re-election was in town the last of the week. 
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Saturnino E. Calac, who is assistant disciplinarian at Sherman Institute, was in town Saturday on business. 

(Mrs.?) A. (Antonio?) Alvarez is moving from the Tenaja country to her place north of town. 

October 13, 1916 

Mr. Roy S. Roripaugh shipped a carload of hogs to the Houser packinghouse at Los Angeles. 

Wednesday morning, Paul Clark had a narrow escape with his life while going home.  He started from town on his 
machine and about a mile south of town, just as he was about to cross a culvert with railing on both sides, Mr. Clark 
lost control of the auto and it ran into the railing smashing the front part of the machine to splinters.  Just as it struck 
the railing it stopped for just a second, Mr. Clark was thrown out, and the machine turned a somersault into the ditch 
upside down.  He received a few cuts on the face.  The machine was brought to town on the two rear wheels. 

Mrs. Roy Swain, of Murrieta, was a weekend visitor of Mr. and Mrs. Charles Swain. 

Mr. and Mrs. Amos Kolb, Merrill Kolb, Dell Clark, Miss Eila Kolb and Miss Jennie (?) returned the rest of the week 
from the mountains where they were camping.  They report having had a very good time. 

Mr. Joe Hamilton of San Jacinto was in town one day last week on business. 

Mr. Robert Magee left Saturday morning for Cahuilla where he has a contract for cutting monuments.  He expects to 
have work there nearly all winter. 

About 20 Indians from the Government reservation at Pechanga passed through town the first of the week on their 
way to El Monte to pick walnuts. 

Mrs. John B. Kelly left Saturday noon by stage for Los Angeles where she will visit her sister, Mrs. John Carr and 
family.  Mrs. Kelly expects to stay in Los Angeles about three or four weeks. 

The bridge over the Temecula River has been completed and now traffic is going over. 

Mr. Parks of Cahuilla brought a bunch of fine cattle the other day, which he shipped to Santa Ana. 

Mr. A. (Elvetzi?) Cantarini, assistant cashier at the bank, made a business trip to Riverside the last of the week, 
returning Sunday evening. 

Mr. C. P. Shumate and Liney D. Helm left for El Centro, Imperial County, the first of the week on very important 
business. 

Mr. Ferrall Freeman left Sunday for Imperial. 

Friday evening a Sunday school party was held at the church.  The children had a very good time. 

Miss Irene Vardy and Miss Ethel Hall made a pleasure trip to San Bernardino where Miss Vardy visited her parents.  
They returned home Sunday evening in company with Mr. Pettrie and Mr. Snyder. 

October 20, 1916 

Mr. and Mrs. W. H. White and Mr. and Mrs. George Simon and baby daughter Lois, arrived from Los Angeles 
Saturday evening and returned home Monday afternoon.  While here they were guests of Mr. and Mrs. Frank Hall 
and family.  Mr., White, and Mrs. Simon came up for two days' quail hunt.  

Albert F. Nienke, lumber dealer, sold to the Red Mountain Ranch a carload of pressed brick this week. 
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Two carloads of lumber for Mr. Nienke arrived the last of the week. 

Mr. and Mrs. A. Cantarini and family motored to Riverside the last of the week to visit the county fair. 

Mr. and Mrs. George A. Burnham, Miss Ethel Burnham, Miss Ethel Hall and Miss Irene Vardy spent Sunday at 
Riverside. 

Juan Munoa and Mrs. Eliza Alvarez motored to San Marcos the last of the week on business, returning the same day. 

P. Speziali and Elvetzi A. Cantarini left Saturday afternoon for Los Angeles returning Monday night. 

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Golsh moved to Pala last Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Banks, Mrs. J. E. Freeman and Mrs. Rosa Arviso went to Pala Saturday to christen Mrs. J. E. 
Freeman's baby boy. 

Mrs. William W. Allen and son Derrell returned home the last of the week from Rainbow. 

Rollo Brown of Murrieta is about through hauling blocks for Joe Winkels. 

Joe Albanas of Potrero was in town one day last week giving Mrs. Nieves Mouren some Indian treatments for 
sickness. 

Mr. and Mrs. Curtis Stevenson and son Harwood, Mrs. Andreas Tortuga and grandson, Johnny, motored to Riverside 
Sunday to take in the fair. 

Alex J. Escallier and Ole Larsen motored to Los Angeles Monday morning to be gone a few days. 

The dance given at the home of Mr. and Mrs. John Cantarini at French Valley, last Saturday night was well attended. 

October 27, 1916 

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Burnham motored to Riverside Friday to take in the circus. 

Frank W. Emerson, orator and lecturer representing the "Out to Win" Prohibition campaign, was in town one day last 
week and delivered a very interesting address before a few of the town people.  Mr. Emerson is a very entertaining 
speaker. 

In the very near future a newspaper will be started at the Murrieta Hot Springs.  The paper will be called "The Desert 
Stem-winder".  It will be edited by Mr. Austin, and John Magee will be his helper.  The editor promises to have all 
kinds of columns one in particular, the devil's column, but in our opinion the name is not appropriate for any kind of 
newspaper in our beautiful valley. 

Mr. and Mrs. Curtis Stevenson of the Barnett ranch were guest of Mr. and Mrs. Ventura Arviso Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Alfred Knott and the twin babies spent Sunday at Murrieta visiting relatives and friends. 

Miss Emma Fay Tortuga is staying with her grandparents out in the country. 

The Vail brothers have brought over a thousand head of cattle from Warner's Ranch.  For a number of years they 
have had the Warner's ranch leased, this year they did not lease it again, and so they brought their cattle to the 
Pauba Ranch.  Some of the cattle mostly calves were shipped to the Santa Rosa Islands to be fattened for the 
market. 
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In a week or two Mrs. Eliza Alvarez and Juan Munoa will move to San Marcos where they will farm next year.  They 
have leased the Meadow Park farm containing nine hundred acres of good land. 

The Barton auto truck took a large crowd to the dance at Murrieta Saturday night. 

Paul Clark has now six wagons hauling beets to the station.  He hauls 15 tons daily. 

Mrs. Kolb, family, and Mrs. Swain were weekend visitors of Mr. and Mrs. Charles Swain. 

Marcos Golsh of Rincon was in town Saturday looking after business interests. 

Mrs. Antonio Ashman and children were weekend visitors of Mrs. D. J. Tortuga. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Cantarini spent Sunday at the home of Mr. and Mrs. Carl Swanguen. 

Engineer Summerville who two years ago was running the passenger train on the Santa Fe line between here and 
San Bernardino, is back again and running over the same road. 

Mr. and Mrs. George Burnham and daughter Ethel and Miss Ethel Hall spent Sunday at San Marcos. 

Mike Pomo met with a very serious accident Sunday while hauling hay.  He was going to get on the wagon but his 
foot slipped, he fell under, the team started, and one of the wheels went over his head.  He was taken to the city 
hospital at Riverside.  Mr. Pomo for the past year has been looking after the Pauba Ranch dairy.  At the present 
writing Mr. Pomo is in a very critical condition. 

George Hall left for Bakersfield recently, driving a team for Ed Ludy. 

Wednesday of the week Ed Ludy and his family will move to Bakersfield where he will farm in the future.  Mr. Ludy 
has leased 160 acres of good land with 40 acres in alfalfa.  Mr. Ludy's many friends express regret in learning of his 
intended departure but it is for the better.  Mr. Ludy has lived in the valley since he was eight years of age.  He has 
been farming all this time, but with very little success.  So now he is going to try other fields.  We wish Mr. Ludy and 
family a very successful future. 

Mrs. William W. Allen and Mrs. Nieves Mouren went to Riverside one day last week returning the same day. 

John N. Carr of Los Angeles arrived Friday and is the guest of Mr. and Mrs. John B. Kelly. 

A large number of town folk attended the masquerade dance given at Murrieta Saturday night. 

Mrs. John B. Kelly returned home the last of the week after spending two weeks with her sister, Mrs. Carr at Los 
Angeles. 

November 3, 1916 

Frank Magee who left for San Diego six weeks ago returned home the last of the week. 

Mr. Yarger of Escondido went through town Monday afternoon.  Mr. Yarger is a shoemaker at Escondido.  He was on 
his way to Riverside. 

Eli E. Barnett, president of the First National bank, made a business trip to Los Angeles. 

Mr. and Mrs. Al Knott and the twins spent Sunday at Murrieta with their parents. 

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Tripp of Aguanga were in town Saturday and Sunday doing some shopping. 
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Albert F. Nienke has started to build a house 18 X 24.  Parts of it will be his office and the rest he will use to store 
cement and lime in. 

Clinton Tripp of Aguanga was in town the last of the week hauling lumber. 

The dance given at the Bank hall Saturday night was well attended.  Supper was served at Mrs. Lizzie M. Hall's 
lunchrooms. 

D. E. Cantarini, Arthur Serval and Dan Cantarini motored to San Diego last week to take in the fair.  They expect to 
be gone a week. 

Divine service was said at the bank hall Sunday morning.  Father Burri officiating. 

Mac Machado has for sale some very fine Navajo blankets at very reasonable prices. 

Angel Ledisma, beet contractor at the Pauba Ranch, brought more men for the work.  Mr. Ledisma says that in about 
three more weeks the work will be done. 

Thursday of last week Mrs. William W. Allen left for Riverside with her son Derrell, who was taken sick a week ago.  
He was taken to the Riverside City hospital.  At the present writing it was learned that he was improving. 

One night last week assistant cashier at the bank, Elvetzi A. Cantarini, was going home on his motorcycle at about 30 
miles an hour, when just as he was nearing home two horses walked form under some trees into the road.  He 
missed the first horse, lost control of his machine, and struck the second horse.  The machine stopped and Mr. 
Cantarini went over the horse and landed on his back about 10 yards on the other side of the horse.  He got up as 
quickly as he could but he couldn't find his machine.  He started after the horse but soon found that what he was 
looking for was his machine.  The machine was put out of commission but the horse is all right, as is Mr. Cantarini.  
The next day Mr. Cantarini brought the motor to the garage and it is now undergoing repairs.  Nobody was hurt but 
the machine was badly hurt. 

Word has been received here that Mike Pomo is improving nicely.  A week ago Mr. Pomo was hurt by a wagon 
running over him at the Pauba Ranch. 

November 10, 1916 

James Rawson, at the little Temecula School and Miss Irene Vardy principal at the Temecula Union School left 
Saturday morning for Cahuilla.  While there they will be guests of the Parks over Sunday. 

Robert Magee arrived from Cahuilla the last of the week. 

James Higgins of Pala was in town one day this week looking after business interests. 

Mrs. E. J. Holland returned home Saturday evening from an extended trip through some of the eastern states.  She 
spent some time at her former home in the state of Ohio.  She says she had a very pleasant trip but was glad to get 
home. 

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Banks spent Sunday at San Jacinto visiting relatives and friends returning Monday. 

Mrs. William W. Allen and son Derrell returned home from Riverside Friday evening. 

Mrs. C. Wulst of Rainbow was a guest over Sunday of Mr. and Mrs. William W. Allen. 

Mrs. Frank Camacho left for San Diego by auto stage Friday afternoon.  She expects to be gone for about ten days.  
While there she will visit the fair. 
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Paul Thompson of Aguanga was in town one-day last week selling pears and transacting business. 

Joe Winkels is through cutting blocks.  Mr. Winkels had a contract to ship to Los Angeles and San Pedro. 

J. Johnson has leased a piece of land from Joe Ackerman and is building a comfortable house where he expects to 
pass this winter. 

Mr. Angel Ledisma, who for the past four days was on the sick list, left for Los Angeles the last of the week for 
medical treatment. 

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Golsh and Emily of Murrieta moved into town the last of the week.  Mrs. Golsh has rented rooms 
at the rear of John B. Kelly's pool hall.  In about a week, Mr. Golsh expects to open a lunch counter.  Her tamales and 
coffee on Saturday and Sunday will be served. 

Supervisor John Shaver and his son Frances of San Jacinto were in town Sunday morning.  In the afternoon they 
motored to Wolf Valley accompanied by Frank Hall, Joseph Winkels, Jacques Escallier and Pat Speziali, road 
master, to view the proposed road that is to be built form Temecula to the county line via Pala. 

James Crew who has a large crop of potatoes at the Pauba Ranch returned Monday afternoon from Azusa with all 
the implements that are required to dig the potatoes. 

Mr. Gray from Pala was in town Monday evening looking after business interests. 

November 17, 1916 

Mr. and Mrs. F. Scott of Pala were first of the week visitors of Mr. and Mrs. Ventura Arviso. 

Mr. Joe Estrada of San Jacinto was in town one day this week, looking after business interests. 

Mrs. Eliza Alvarez and Mr. Juan Monua moved to San Marcos Saturday.  They have leased the Meadow Park farm 
and will put it in grain.  The farm contains about nine hundred acres of good land. 

Mr. Robert J. Magee left Saturday morning for Cahuilla, where he has been doing some monument work.  Mr. Magee 
understands the stone business. 

Mr. Angel Ledisma left for Los Angeles Thursday noon, to bring more men to work at the Pauba Ranch, plowing out 
beets. 

Mrs. J. E. Freeman and son left early Wednesday morning for Los Angeles where they will remain for a week's visit. 

Mrs. J. C. Rodriguez of Escondido arrived here this week for a visit with her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Albert Banks. 

Mr. Pat Speziali, road master, made a trip to San Jacinto, Wednesday. 

Daniel Cantarini, a very prominent young man residing just north of town, has secured employment at the Mission 
store.  Dan is a willing worker. 

Mr. Mark Robertson of Aguanga was in town the first of the week buying lumber. 

Mr. F. Castillo of Pala spent the weekend with Mr. Frank Camacho. 

Mr. and Mrs. C. P. Shumate and son spent one day last week in Riverside. 

Mr. Griflis of Murrieta was in town the last of the week transacting business. 
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November 24, 1916 

 

After a three-week's visit with Mr. and Mrs. John B. Kelly, Mrs. John Carr left for Los Angeles Monday noon by auto 
stage.  After a week or so spent in that city, Mrs. Carr will leave for a visit with her daughter to San Francisco. 

Frank H. Hall and Pat Speziali made a business trip to Riverside Tuesday. 

Mrs. M. Chawa and children arrived home Monday night from Riverside where Mr. Chawa has been working on the 
highway for the past two months. 

Mrs. Francisca Escallier left for Los Angeles Tuesday noon by auto stage.   

Frank Tripp of Aguanga was in town one day this week, looking after business interests. 

Albert F. Nienke, lumber dealer, sold a large bill of lumber to some Pala people this week. 

The Pauba Ranch is hauling and shipping some very fine alfalfa hay. 

Cashier C. P. Shumate and Assistant Cashier, Elvetzi A. Cantarini, motored to (?) Wednesday afternoon to attend the 
Eastern lodge. 

Mrs. Eila Kolb left for Riverside the first of the week to continue her studies at the Riverside business college. 

(Sererino?) Mejado of Pala is doing the carpenter work for Mr. Nienke. 

Mr. and Mrs. A. M. Lobaugh of Happy Valley Ranch and Mrs. Andreas Tortuga left for Los Angeles early Saturday 
morning. 

Antonio Ashman arrived Friday night from Oxnard, where for the past two months he has been working. 

Paul Cantarini and Pat Speziali took in the auto races at Santa Monica.  They report a good time. 

Curtis Stevenson left Monday afternoon by auto stage for Fallbrook where he expects to start a shoe shop. 

December 1, 1916 

J. E. Freeman, wife and children left Saturday noon by auto stage for Colton.  They expect to spend two or three 
months before returning to El Centro, where Mr. Freeman is engaged in the dairy business. 

Arthur and Leon Serval went to Riverside one day this week to get their second naturalization papers. 

Juan Monua arrived home from San Marcos the last of the week where he and Mrs. Alvarez have leased land to 
seed. 

The Vail Bros. shipped three carloads of cattle and one of hogs Tuesday afternoon. 

John Falkner died Tuesday afternoon at the home of John B. Kelly.  Mr. Falkner has lived in this valley a good many 
years.  He was one of the old settlers.  Mr. Falkner died at the advanced age of 90 years. 

Albert Banks and wife motored to Riverside Tuesday morning returning the same day.  They visited their daughter 
Esther who is attending the Riverside business college. 

Albert F. Nienke made a business trip to Riverside Monday. 
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Juan Morena is building a new porch in front of Kelly's poolroom. 

Frank Tripp of Aguanga is in town looking after business interests. 

Paul Clark is through with his sugar beet crop for this year.  He had a good crop. 

James Crew and Wong Gar have started digging potatoes.  They have a large force of Mexicans at work. 

Mike Pomo, foreman at the Pauba Ranch dairy, who was hurt some time ago by a wagon has almost entirely 
recovered and is back at work again. 

Harvey Helms, who has been working at El Centro for the past year, arrived here the first of the week. 

Messrs. Miller and Storm of Ontario stopped in town one day last week, while on their way to Warner's ranch where 
they have homesteads. 

J. E. Freeman of El Centro has been transacting business here the past few days.  He is in the dairy business at El 
Centro and is doing well. 

Last Saturday night a masquerade dance was given at the home of Mr. and Mrs. John Cantarini at French Valley.  
Many of the town people attended it and report a good time. 

Mrs. Frank Camacho arrived home the last of the week from San Diego, where she visited friends and relatives the 
past two weeks. 

December 8, 1916News 

 
Catholic Church for Temecula 

 
A meeting of businessmen was held in the Bank hall at Temecula Monday night, Dec. 4.  Mr. Shumate, cashier of the 
Temecula bank, was chairman.  There were present Rev. J. J. Burri, August Cantarini, Mr. Barnett, Mac Machado 
and other prominent citizens.  It was the third meeting that has been held. 
 
It is planned to build a Catholic church in Temecula and the businessmen generally think it will be a good thing for the 
town.  Six town lots have been secured on the main boulevard near the beautiful new grammar school.  Mac 
Machado, a popular public spirited merchant, made a liberal donation on the price of two lots and the Santa Fe Ry. 
Co. did likewise on the other four, so the new church is provided with six sightly building lots. 
 
Rev. J. J. Burri has been very successful in raising funds.  If built of stone, the stone will be donated and if parties can 
be induced to donate the hauling, it will be possible to build a church valued at $3,000 to $4,000.  If a wood frame 
church be decided upon, a frame structure to cost about $1500 will be erected. 
 
Five hundred dollars cash has been donated through the Catholic Church Extension Society of Chicago.  An altar 
from the same source has been donated.  The society secured the money from a wealthy gentleman in the east.  The 
Diocese of the Catholic Church of Southern California purchased the lots.  Towards the building fund $500 is 
promised, but it is hoped that the total will be much greater.  Work will begin very soon and the new church will be 
completed early in January. 
 
Temecula is certainly coming to the front.  In the past year a fine new two-story concrete bank building was erected.  
The new bank is in a very prosperous condition.  A beautiful new grammar school has been opened and now it is 
proposed to build a handsome church. 
 
Mac Machado, the prominent merchant, is the pioneer in building a beautiful and costly store building.  The Machado 
store is one of the best attractions in Temecula. 

December 8, 1916 Gossip 
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Last Saturday night a birthday party was celebrated at Lizzie M. Hall's lunchrooms in honor of Paul Clark of the 
Pauba Ranch.  The tables were beautifully decorated and a very delicious supper was served.  The invited guest who 
came to honor the occasion were:  Mr. and Mrs. Clark of Norwalk, Mr. and Mrs. Kurtz of Pauba Ranch.  Mr. and Mrs. 
Frank Hall, Mr. and Mrs. Lyn Smith, Mr. and Mrs. Carl Swanguen, Miss Ethel Hall, Miss Irene Vardy, F. (Lucien?) 
Snyder, George D. Pettrie, Ruth Keyes and J. V. Gibbs. 

Lucien Snyder left for San Bernardino Saturday morning.  Prior to his leaving here, Mr. Snyder was a telegraph 
operator and he goes to San Bernardino to take an examination for a higher office as an operator.  All his many 
friends wish him a very successful career in the future. 

All business was stopped here on Thanksgiving and most of the people spent the day outside of town. 

James O. Freeman went to San Diego Sunday on very important business. 

Miss Eila Kolb, who is attending the Riverside Business College, spent Thanksgiving Day with her parents at 
Temecula. 

Mrs. John N. Carr of Los Angeles arrived last week and is visiting her sister, Mrs. John B. Kelly. 

Wong Gar, who has a large crop of potatoes at the Pauba Ranch, left for Los Angeles Saturday afternoon to get 
pointers on the potato market. 

John B. Kelly is improving the front of his poolroom.  He is having a new porch built. 

Frank Bohm and wife of Downey spent Sunday at the home of Adrian B. Barnett. 

R. E. Proval of Murrieta was in town Saturday looking after his business interests. 

Albert F. Nienke has moved into his new office, which has been finished recently. 

After spending a pleasant week's vacation with John B. Kelly and wife, Mrs. (John) M. Carr returned to her home in 
Los Angeles Tuesday morning. 

Mrs. Eliza Alvarez and son John of San Marcos was in town for two days.  Mrs. Alvarez was transacting important 
business. 

Frank L. Fernald made a business trip to San Diego one day last week. 

Misses Irene Vardy and Ethel Hall spent Thanksgiving at San Bernardino, where Miss Vardy's parents reside.  They 
returned Sunday night having had a most enjoyable time. 

James Crew, who planted potatoes at the Pauba Ranch, says that he expects to have 5,000 sacks of spuds this year. 

James Tortuga and wife returned home Saturday from Hemet where they had been picking olives. 

Miss Esther Banks, who is attending the Riverside Business College, spent Thanksgiving vacation with her parents in 
Temecula. 

Angel Ledisma made a business trip to Riverside the first of the week. 

Mrs. Rex Swain of Murrieta was visiting in Temecula one day this week. 

December 15, 1916 
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W. H. White and wife, Mrs. Simon and daughter of Los Angeles, arrived Sunday and were guests of Frank Hall and 
family, returning home Monday by auto. 

Mr. Bailly of Aguanga was in town the first of the week buying lumber. 

Miss Ethel left Monday noon by auto for Los Angeles where she will attend high school. 

A. E. Miller of Murrieta was a business caller in town Tuesday. 

Mrs. William M. Kolb was visiting her daughter Eila in Riverside last week. 

James Crew and Wong Gar have shipped ten carloads of spuds to Los Angeles and they expect to ship another ten 
within the next few days. 

Sam Brady of the Murrieta Hot Springs was in town the first of the week having some work done at the blacksmith 
shop. 

Paul Clark, Ruth Keyes, Ethel Hall, Lucien Snyder, George D. Pettrie and Irene Vardy attended the dance at the Pitt 
in Elsinore. 

Antonio R. Ashman and family have moved to their farm from the Charles Cantarini place, where they have been 
working for the past three months. 

Carl Swanguen, who lives up on the hill, had the misfortune to lose two valuable horses by falling into a ravine.  Mr. 
Swanguen came to town the same day and took back two men to help him pull the horses out, but it was too late as 
the horses died soon after. 

D. J. Woosley of Escondido was in town the last of the week looking after his business interests. 

F. B. Rodriguez, who was in the walnut business at El Monte, arrived in Temecula the last of the week.  Mr. 
Rodriguez says that the walnuts were good even better than ever. 

Eva Calac and Julia Amago of the Wolf Valley were in town one day this week doing some Christmas shopping. 

Edward Somerville and wife left for Etiwanda Wednesday morning.  For the past four years Mr. Somerville has been 
station agent here for the Santa Fe.  He goes to Etiwanda to hold the same position as here.  Mr. and Mrs. Somerville 
while here had many friends who wish them every success in their new home. 

George Hall, who for the past six months was working at McFarland, Kern County, returned to Temecula, Tuesday. 

Tom Scott, who was station agent at Alesandro, has filled the vacancy here as station agent. 

Mrs. John B. Kelly left for Los Angeles by auto stage the last of the week.  She will spend the holidays there with her 
sister and friends. 

After spending a few days visiting with relatives and friends in Los Angeles, Mrs. Lizzie M. Hall returned home 
Sunday. 

The coldest day we have had this winter was Saturday, when the thermometer went down to 16 degrees above zero. 

Last Friday night a C. E. special was held at the church to which everybody was invited.  All had an enjoyable time. 

Albert F. Nienke's new office is receiving a new coat of paint, which improves the looks of the building. 
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William T. Barton had the misfortune of burning one of his hands Sunday morning.  He is the night watchman at the 
Santa Fe Yards.  The oil by the engine caught fire and in trying to extinguish it Mr. Barton burned his hand. 

Jean Nicolas of French Valley was in town one day this week looking after business interests. 

Albert F. Nienke has an option on a large bill of lumber for the Fruit Association at Fallbrook.  The Association is 
planning to build a large storage warehouse at Fallbrook in the near future. 

December 22, 1916 

Mrs. Preston V. Swanguen is helping this week at the lunchrooms in the absence of Mrs. Lizzie M. Hall, who was 
taken to Los Angeles sick. 

Henry Hamilton of Cahuilla was a business visitor in town the first of the week. 

Frank Ramos, who is attending school at Riverside, came home Saturday night to spend the holidays. 

Mrs. Carl Wust of Rainbow was a weekend guest of Mr. and Mrs. William W. Allen. 

Mark A. Robertson and sons of Aguanga were in town the first of the week buying lumber. 

J. S. Feliz, foreman at the Pauba Ranch, and who has been a faithful employee of the Vail brothers for the past 
seven or eight years, left last week for Santa Barbara, to be foreman at one of the Vail ranches there. 

Mrs. George Simon arrived Monday from Los Angeles and will be in charge of Lizzie M. Hall's lunchrooms. 

The pool hall of John B. Kelly is undergoing repairs.  The building had to be raised and props put under it. 

Angel Ledisma returned to the Pauba Ranch Wednesday night from Riverside where he went last week to transact 
important business. 

Albert Golsh and wife returned Sunday from Pala, where Mr. Golsh has been working. 

Vail Bros. shipped eighteen carloads of cattle to Santa Barbara Thursday, where they will be fattened for market.  
They were in charge of Pat Speziali. 

Mrs. Lizzie M. Hall, who was on the sick list a few days here, was taken to the hospital in Los Angeles where an 
operation was performed.  Word has been received that she is improving.  Her daughter, Mrs. Swanguen, 
accompanied her. 

James Higgins of Pala was in town the last of the week doing some trading. 

Paul Thompson was in town Tuesday selling winter pears and oranges. 

Miss Florence Willits, who teaches school at Fellows, is visiting Miss Irene Vardy, the teacher here.  They are school 
chums. 

Miss Mary Cazas, who has been away for the past year, returned last week and will spend the holidays here. 

H. C. Hind was business visitor from Murrieta, Friday. 

P. Alvarez and family have moved to town. 

The Misses Vardy and Willits left for San Bernardino the last of the week, where they will spend part of their vacation. 
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December 29, 1916 

Mr. and Mrs. Al Knott and twins left for Westminister to spend a few days visiting his parents.  Mr. Knott is our 
blacksmith and during his absence Jay Abbott will be in full charge. 

Albert Banks and wife and daughter, Mrs. J. C. Rodriguez motored to Riverside Saturday in bring their daughter, 
Esther returning the same day. 

Last Saturday night a dance was given at Johnny Cantarini's residence in which many from here attended.  They all 
say that they had an enjoyable time. 

Rollo Brown has two teams hauling stone from Pat Quinn's quarry to his place near Murrieta where he is going to 
build a storehouse in the very near future. 

The Christmas exercises at the Temecula Union School by the children were a grand success and enjoyed by all with 
the exception of the accident that happened to Felipe Magee, who was playing Santa Claus.  While distributing the 
presents the cotton on his clothes caught fire from a burning candle.  His arms were burnt in trying to put the fire out, 
but not seriously. 

The credit of successful Christmas entertainment is due to the Misses Vardy and Alma Friedemann, teachers, who 
take great interest and have much patience with the children. 

Many people from Pala were in town Saturday doing Christmas shopping. 

Domingo Morro of Pala was in town one day last week buying lumber.  He is building a handsome bungalow for his 
family. 

James Crew, potato planter at the Pauba Ranch is plowing more land, getting it ready for the potatoes for next 
spring.  HE says that he will plant more than before. 

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Tripp and son spent Christmas in town, returning home Tuesday. 

Word has been received from Los Angeles that Mrs. Lizzie M. Hall, who was taken there two weeks ago sick, is 
improving very nicely.  Her many friends wish her a speedy recovery. 

Juan Munoa and Frank Golsh made a business trip to Murrieta the last of the week. 

Angel Cantarini, a very successful farmer of Moreno valley went by town one day last week to one of his ranches 
about two miles south of Temecula. 

Elvetzi A. and Paul Cantarini made a pleasure trip to Riverside Saturday afternoon returning home Sunday night by 
way of Winchester. 

Al L. Otto of Aguanga was in town the last of the week buying lumber and cement. 

Mr. and Mrs. A. M. Lobaugh of Happy Valley Ranch and Mrs. Tortuga of Pechanga motored to Los Angeles last 
Friday morning.  They will spend Christmas there.  Mrs. A. Tortuga will spend Christmas at home of her nieces the 
Medrans, Mr., and Mrs. Lobaugh with friends and relatives. 

Mrs. J. C. Rodriguez of Escondido arrived the first of the week and is visiting with her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Albert 
Banks. 

Last week F. Austin of Rainbow had a runaway, the horses running about three miles before being caught and 
scattering vegetables all along the road. 
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Lucien Snyder left last week for Corona, where he has secured employment as operator on the Santa Fe.  Snyder 
was telegraph operator here for the past year. 

Miss Esther Banks, who is attending the Riverside Business College, arrived home the last of the week where she 
will spend part of the holidays. 

Wong Gar, potato Bug, is spending a few days in Los Angeles looking after business interests. 

Angel Ledisma made a business trip to Riverside this week. 

Mrs. Eliza Alvarez and son John of San Marcos are in town spending a few days looking after business interests.  
Mrs. Alvarez says that she has over 200 acres planted to barley and wheat and expects to put in more in the next 
three weeks if it doesn't rain too much. 

Mr. and Mrs. Mac Machado spent Christmas day at the Cantarini's farm. 

James Rawson, teacher at the Temecula School spent the holidays abroad. 

Robert J. Magee who for the past two months has been doing some stone work at Cahuilla was in town one day last 
week arranging his business interests before leaving for Los Angeles where he will remain a few days getting 
pointers on stone business. 

 


